Milwaukee County Procurement Division 1of8
Bid Opening Results
BID/QUOTE # [631109 COMMODITY: Zoo Paper Products OPEN DATE: 12/5/2013
Vendor E.R. Abernathy[Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food [North America |The Boelter Co |Clean Rite
Vendor #
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Line# [Qty
1 18 16.2700 33.3900 No Bid 18.7800 15.6800 16.3600 15.4900
Extended | 292.86 601.02] 0.00 338.04| 282.24 294.48]| 278.82
2 19 49.0300 80.8600 No Bid 51.0300 47.2500 46.5000 46.9700
Extended | 931.57 1536.34| 0.00 969.57| 897.75 883.50 892.43
3 14 59.3400 47.1100 No Bid 74.2200 * 25.44 *71.97 * 25.29
Extended | 830.76 659.54] 0.00 1039.08| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
4 2 41.9700 49.1700 No Bid 67.6700 40.4400 4.8600 40.6500
Extended | 83.94 08.34] 0.00 135.34] 80.88 9.72] 81.30
5 24 No Bid 23.7600 No Bid 75.7500 No Bid 103.0000 * 48.50
Extended | 0.00 570.24] 0.00 1818.00| 0.00 2472.00| 0.00
6 12 *88.57 113.2800 No Bid 76.8700 * 85.34 * 76.68 * 84.70
Extended | 0.00 1359.36| 0.00 922.44| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
7 24 *182.37 106.7600 No Bid 48.5600 No Bid 76.6800 * 60.65
Extended | 0.00 2562.24| 0.00 1165.44)| 0.00 1840.32| 0.00
8 14 *130.18 80.4400 No Bid 48.3600 No Bid 76.6800 * 103.73
Extended | 0.00 1126.16| 0.00 677.04] 0.00 1073.52| 0.00
9 19 9.6400 17.3200 No Bid 10.7800 9.2900 9.1900 9.2400
Extended | 183.16 329.08| 0.00 204.82] 176.51 174.61| 175.56
10 29 14.0900 26.0200 No Bid 11.2500 13.5800 12.8700 13.5000
Extended 408.61 754.58 0.00 326.25 393.82 373.23 391.50
SUBTOTAL 2730.90 9596.90 0.00 7596.02 1831.20 7121.38 1819.61
BUYER NAME: PHONE:
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results

20f8

BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy|Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
11 4 12.2400 * 36.99 No Bid 25.5000 28.0900 17.1300 27.6600
Extended | 48.96 0.00| 0.00 102.00| 112.36 68.52] 110.64
12 1 35.1500 32.8900 No Bid 32.1600 33.8700 4.1100 33.6600
Extended | 35.15 32.89| 0.00 32.16| 33.87 4.11] 33.66
13 63 16.4400 59.6100 * 64.00 22.2700 15.8400 * 44.73 15.5000
Extended | 1035.72 3755.43] 0.00 1403.01 | 997.92 0.00] 976.50
14 34 41.3900 27.0700 * 48.00 32.7800 39.8800 35.5800 39.6400
Extended | 1407.26 920.38| 0.00 1114.52| 1355.92 1209.72] 1347.76
15 28 24.6600 38.8300 No Bid 28.2500 * 21.51 * 20.78 * 23.62
Extended | 690.48 1087.24| 0.00 791.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
16 36 24.3900 41.0100 No Bid 21.9500 * 20.75 * 20.04 * 22.26
Extended | 878.04 1476.36| 0.00 790.20| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
17 20 39.7500 56.8600 No Bid 25.7500 * 33.78 *16.83 * 35.80
Extended | 795.00 1137.20| 0.00 515.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
18 20 29.0900 64.5100 No Bid 26.5500 24.6400 23.8000 26.6000
Extended | 581.80 1290.20| 0.00 531.00| 492.80 476.00| 532.00
19 75 68.0500 80.8800 No Bid 34.2000 * 65.57 * 59.97 * 64.25
Extended | 5103.75 6066.00| 0.00 2565.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
20 26 80.0500 110.9000 No Bid 36.2800 * 77.14 * 69.20 * 76.67
Extended 2081.30 2883.40 0.00 943.28 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 12657.46 18649.10 0.00 8787.17 2992.87 1758.35 3000.56
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results

30f8

BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy|Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
21 3 31.6400 68.9900 No Bid 28.8400 30.4900 69.1100 30.3100
Extended | 94.92 206.97| 0.00 86.52| 91.47 207.33] 90.93
22  31*92.15 75.8500 No Bid * 20.79 * 88.80 No Bid * 29.69
Extended | 0.00 2351.35] 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
23 8 63.1700 34.4700 No Bid 31.6300 * 31.69 33.5000 * 37.76
Extended | 505.36 275.76] 0.00 253.04] 0.00 268.00] 0.00
24 16 36.8400 78.0200 No Bid 20.7800 * 35.50 No Bid * 46.50
Extended | 589.44 1248.32| 0.00 332.48] 0.00 0.00] 0.00
25 35 23.0600 49.3800 32.0000 24.9900 22.2200 46.9800 21.9000
Extended | 807.10 1728.30| 1120.00 874.65| 777.70 1644.30| 766.50
26 55 23.0600 49.3800 32.0000 24.9900 22.2200 46.9800 21.9000
Extended | 1268.30 2715.90| 1760.00 1374.45| 1222.10 2583.90| 1204.50
27 121 23.0600 30.0800 32.0000 24.9900 22.2200 46.9800 21.9000
Extended | 2790.26 3639.68| 3872.00 3023.79| 2688.62 5684.58| 2649.90
28 20 43.2500 40.4000 No Bid 31.0300 58.2800 38.0400 56.9600
Extended | 865.00 808.00| 0.00 620.60| 1165.60 760.80 1139.20
29 200 No Bid 18.0700 No Bid 8.9900 No Bid No Bid 8.6500
Extended | 0.00 3614.00| 0.00 1798.00| 0.00 0.00] 1730.00
30 11 No Bid * 43.92 No Bid * 39.99 No Bid No Bid 26.3200
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 289.52
SUBTOTAL 6920.38 16588.28 6752.00 8363.53 5945.49 11148.91 7870.55
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy|Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
31 600 *70.58 42.7600 No Bid 39.1500 * 55.07 * 45.69 *51.50
Extended | 0.00 25656.00| 0.00 23490.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
32 300 32.0200 25.1200 No Bid 26.2400 * 27.80 26.8600 *29.90
Extended | 9606.00 7536.00| 0.00 7872.00| 0.00 8058.00| 0.00
33 12 *45.66 48.3900 No Bid 34.8400 * 39.63 * 38.29 * 41.65
Extended | 0.00 580.68] 0.00 418.08| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
34 51 10.4500 10.7400 No Bid 14.2900 10.0700 12.9600 9.9000
Extended | 532.95 547.74] 0.00 728.79| 513.57 660.96/ 504.90
35 10 6.9500 59.3200 No Bid 19.4900 No Bid 26.7700 9.9000
Extended | 69.50 593.20| 0.00 194.90| 0.00 267.70] 99.00
36 3 No Bid 44.1700 No Bid *33.32 * 39.50 * 45.50 * 38.26
Extended | 0.00 132.51| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
37 48 10.4500 10.7400 No Bid 14.8200 10.0700 12.9600 * 9.90
Extended | 501.60 515.52] 0.00 711.36| 483.36 622.08| 0.00
38 10 6.9500 41.0800 No Bid 19.4900 No Bid 7.9400 9.9000
Extended | 69.50 410.80| 0.00 194.90| 0.00 79.40] 99.00
39 2 *40.99 44.1700 No Bid * 33.53 * 39.50 * 45.50 * 38.26
Extended | 0.00 88.34| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
40 96 10.4500 16.4100 No Bid 13.9600 10.0700 9.9100 9.9000
Extended 1003.20 1575.36 0.00 1340.16 966.72 951.36 950.40
SUBTOTAL 11782.75 37636.15 0.00 34950.19 1963.65 10639.50 1653.30
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy|Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
41 8 6.9500 41.1900 No Bid 19.4900 No Bid 6.4800 9.9000
Extended | 55.60 329.52] 0.00 155.92| 0.00 51.84] 79.20
42 4 * 40.99 42.7400 No Bid * 33.24 * 39.50 * 45.50 * 38.26
Extended | 0.00 170.96| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
43 28 10.4500 11.3300 No Bid 14.6800 10.0700 9.9100 6.6500
Extended | 292.60 317.24] 0.00 411.04] 281.96 277.48] 186.20
44 12 11.7400 13.4000 No Bid 17.7800 11.3100 11.1300 9.9000
Extended | 140.88 160.80| 0.00 213.36] 135.72 133.56 118.80
45 14 No Bid 90.9300 No Bid 77.6600 88.1400 77.8300 85.6600
Extended | 0.00 1273.02| 0.00 1087.24| 1233.96 1089.62] 1199.24
46 10 No Bid 104.8600 No Bid 109.6600 94.0500 91.0000 91.9000
Extended | 0.00 1048.60| 0.00 1096.60| 940.50 910.00| 919.00
47 13 No Bid 44.9900 No Bid 52.2300 * 88.94 * 35.60 * 86.50
Extended | 0.00 584.87| 0.00 678.99| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
48 17 No Bid 123.2200 No Bid 125.4100 * 88.92 * 87.51 * 85.41
Extended | 0.00 2094.74] 0.00 2131.97| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
49 2 *10.36 34.0900 No Bid * 26.86 *9.98 * 66.49 *9.92
Extended | 0.00 68.18| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
50 42 131.3900 62.3200 No Bid * 69.95 * 86.22 114.7400 * 85.70
Extended 5518.38 2617.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 4819.08 0.00
SUBTOTAL 6007.46 8665.37 0.00 5775.12 2592.14 7281.58 2502.44
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy [Sysco Aoss Medical |[Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
51 14 33.5900 38.1300 No Bid 54.2100 32.3700 31.8600 31.9500
Extended | 470.26 533.82] 0.00 758.94] 453.18 446.04] 447.30
52 113 20.7800 * 21.44 No Bid *14.32 *14.12 *13.89 *14.03
Extended | 2348.14 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
53 169 21.7400 18.0000 No Bid 15.2400 14.9700 14.7300 14.5600
Extended | 3674.06 3042.00| 0.00 2575.56| 2529.93 2489.37| 2460.64
54 26 33.2600 36.7900 No Bid 32.1700 32.0500 30.3400 31.8500
Extended | 864.76 956.54] 0.00 836.42] 833.30 788.84] 828.10
55 32 26.2200 20.1900 No Bid 19.9800 36.0200 43.6100 35.8000
Extended | 839.04 646.08] 0.00 639.36] 1152.64 1395.52] 1145.60
56 2 128.0300 49.0300 No Bid 87.6100 89.4500 No Bid *110.94
Extended | 256.06 98.06| 0.00 175.22| 178.90 0.00| 0.00
57| 9 170.0700 64.7700 No Bid 137.2100 * 106.55 * 49.93 161.0000
Extended | 1530.63 582.93] 0.00 1234.89| 0.00 0.00] 1449.00
58 10 12.9800 40.2800 No Bid 12.8500 57.6200 40.6500 11.9000
Extended | 129.80 402.80| 0.00 128.50| 576.20 406.50| 119.00
50 16 41.2100 * 36.11 No Bid 33.7500 * 30.35 * 29.33 28.4500
Extended | 659.36 0.00| 0.00 540.00| 0.00 0.00] 455.20
60 20 *46.63 * 90.97 No Bid *61.28 44.9400 No Bid * 44,67
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 898.80 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 10772.11 6262.23 0.00 6888.89 6622.95 5526.27 6904.84
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy [Sysco Aoss Medical |[Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
61 10 28.1900 73.7100 No Bid 65.8100 27.1600 46.0900 26.6000
Extended | 281.90 737.10| 0.00 658.10| 271.60 460.90| 266.00
62 16 *23.91 65.1400 No Bid * 23.91 * 23.04 * 46.09 * 22.69
Extended | 0.00 1042.24| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
63 12 17.5600 90.9700 No Bid * 68.84 *42.00 No Bid * 4157
Extended | 210.72 1091.64| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
64 19 17.6600 40.4300 No Bid 24.6500 17.0100 17.2000 16.6100
Extended | 335.54 768.17| 0.00 468.35| 323.19 326.80 315.59
65 12 *43.87 46.5700 No Bid 29.8600 29.1100 27.8000 28.6300
Extended | 0.00 558.84] 0.00 358.32] 349.32 333.60 343.56
66 181 * 173.79 20.2500 No Bid 19.9700 * 19.27 37.1700 * 18.45
Extended | 0.00 3665.25| 0.00 3614.57| 0.00 6727.77| 0.00
67 20 *42.49 *37.11 No Bid 39.4400 40.9500 47.8900 39.9000
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 788.80| 819.00 957.80 798.00
68 100 * 12.04 26.3800 No Bid 4.9200 * 11.60 * 9 59 *10.90
Extended | 0.00 2638.00| 0.00 492.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
69 58 No Bid 57.8900 No Bid 54.1900 * 52.91 *17.71 * 52 50
Extended | 0.00 3357.62] 0.00 3143.02] 0.00 0.00] 0.00
70 56 15.1300 12.1100 No Bid 14.4900 * 13.56 12.9200 13.2700
Extended 847.28 678.16 0.00 811.44 0.00 723.52 743.12
SUBTOTAL 1675.44 14537.02 0.00 10334.60 1763.11 9530.39 2466.27
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor E.R. Abernathy|Sysco Aoss Medical |Gordon Food |North America |The Boelter Co [Clean Rite
71 31 83.8200 74.9700 44.0000 68.9000 80.7700 74.3000 37.5000
Extended | 2598.42 2324.07| 1364.00 2135.90| 2503.87 2303.30| 1162.50
72 95 *23.83 *19.67 No Bid 28.5300 * 22.96 * 24.30 * 22.82
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 2710.35] 0.00 0.00| 0.00
73 2 No Bid 102.8700 No Bid * 69.00 No Bid * 46.09 * 59.80
Extended | 0.00 205.74] 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
74 2 No Bid 96.3600 No Bid *61.00 No Bid No Bid * 59.80
Extended | 0.00 192.72| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
75 10 110.5700 95.3600 No Bid 156.9000 95.9300 92.6900 89.6000
Extended | 1105.70 953.60| 0.00 1569.00| 959.30 926.90| 896.00
76 4 51.2300 118.0700 No Bid *99.78 No Bid * 35.60 126.9000
Extended | 204.92 472.28| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 507.60
77 4 110.6400 * 63.36 No Bid * 33.05 No Bid *21.26 *51.92
Extended | 442 .56 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
78 2 64.6600 34.2900 No Bid 24.9200 21.0400 23.5000 37.4000
Extended | 129.32 68.58| 0.00 49.84] 42.08 47.00| 74.80
79 4 16.7200 19.6700 No Bid 34.5100 14.5500 20.0900 14.4700
Extended | 66.88 78.68| 0.00 138.04)| 58.20 80.36) 57.88
80
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 4547.80 4295.67 1364.00 6603.13 3563.45 3357.56 2698.78
TOTAL 57094.30 116230.72 8116.00 89298.65 27274.86 56363.94 28916.35
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # [631109 COMMODITY: Zoo Paper Products OPEN DATE: 12/5/2013
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc
Vendor #
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Line # |Qty
1 18 17.9900 23.7100 17.5300
Extended | 323.82 426.78| 315.54 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
2 19 52.8400 82.8100 52.8500
Extended | 1003.96 1573.39| 1004.15 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
3 14*79.14 * 59.88 * 28.45
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
4 2 46.3900 78.0200 45.2500
Extended | 92.78 156.04] 90.50 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
5  24*215.98 *13.43 No Bid
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
6 12 *158.54 * 72.05 * 95.45
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
7 24 71.1500 * 124.00 No Bid
Extended | 1707.60 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
8 14 78.6500 * 58.34 No Bid
Extended | 1101.10 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
9 19 10.1400 13.5000 10.4000
Extended | 192.66 256.50 197.60 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
10 29 14.8200 17.4600 15.2000
Extended 429.78 506.34 440.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 4851.70 2919.05 2048.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BUYER NAME: PHONE:
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division 20f8
Bid Opening Results
BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
11 4 14.4800 23.6700 31.4500
Extended | 57.92 94.68| 125.80 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
12 1 *37.80 48.6800 37.9000
Extended | 0.00 48.68| 37.90 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
13 63/*39.30 *113.73 17.7500
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 1118.25 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
14 34 *44.05 42.8300 44.6000
Extended | 0.00 1456.22| 1516.40 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
15 28 *25.93 * 26.24 *22.15
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
16 36 *24.72 * 25.29 * 21.35
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
17 20 *40.30 * 60.24 * 34.75
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
18 20 * 29.49 * 56.98 * 25.35
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
19 75 *73.33 * 98.43 * 73.35
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
20 26 *86.27 *102.13 * 86.30
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 57.92 1599.58 2798.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

30f8

BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
21 3 *59.80 * 115.05 * 34.10
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
22 31 37.6300 * 121.11 * 99.35
Extended | 1166.53 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
23 8 * 44.24 * 62.05 * 36.85
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
24 16 *54.09 * 49.79 No Bid
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
25 35 25.4900 26.8000 24.9000
Extended | 892.15 938.00| 871.50 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
26 55 25.4900 26.8000 24.9000
Extended | 1401.95 1474.00| 1369.50 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
27 121 25.4900 26.8000 24.9000
Extended | 3084.29 3242.80| 3012.90 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
28 20 45.0600 43.0300 65.2000
Extended | 901.20 860.60| 1304.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
29 200 11.6700 13.8000 No Bid
Extended | 2334.00 2760.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
30 11 33.2900 No Bid No Bid
Extended 366.19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 10146.31 9275.40 6557.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
31 20 *66.35 *39.00 * 48.65
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
32 300 32.4600 27.4100 28.6000
Extended | 9738.00 8223.00| 8580.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
33 100 * 47.41 * 42.02 * 40.80
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
34 51 10.2100 12.8300 11.3000
Extended | 520.71 654.33] 576.30 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
35 10 15.0400 31.4900 7.6000
Extended | 150.40 314.90| 76.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
36/ 3 *44.18 * 47.25 * 44.20
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
37 48 11.2700 12.8300 11.3000
Extended | 540.96 615.84] 542.40 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
38 10 18.5300 31.4900 7.6000
Extended | 185.30 314.90| 76.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
39 2 *44.18 * 47.25 * 44.20
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
40 96 10.2100 12.8300 11.3000
Extended 980.16 1231.68 1084.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 12115.53 11354.65 10935.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
41 8 18.5300 31.4900 7.6000
Extended | 148.24 251.92] 60.80 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
42 4*44.18 * 47.25 * 44.20
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
43 28 11.2700 12.8300 11.3000
Extended | 315.56 359.24] 316.40 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
44 12 12.8100 24.3900 12.6500
Extended | 153.72 292.68| 151.80 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
45 14 87.7100 82.1800 No Bid
Extended | 1227.94 1150.52| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
46 10 102.0500 103.2900 No Bid
Extended | 1020.50 1032.90| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
47 13 63.0000 63.0200 No Bid
Extended | 819.00 819.26| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
48 17 *62.24 * 59,77 No Bid
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
49 2 11.0300 12.3900 * 11.20
Extended | 22.06 24.78| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
50 42 *95.23 137.5200 * 96.45
Extended 0.00 5775.84 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 3707.02 9707.14 529.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
51 14 36.2000 34.5600 36.2000
Extended | 506.80 483.84] 506.80 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
52 113 *15.99 *19.97 * 15.80
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
53 169 16.9500 20.6500 16.7500
Extended | 2864.55 3489.85| 2830.75 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
54 26 34.8200 39.0500 35.8500
Extended | 905.32 1015.30| 932.10 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
55 32 28.4000 * 37.17 22.0500
Extended | 908.80 0.00| 705.60 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
56 2 91.0800 102.9600 No Bid
Extended | 182.16 205.92] 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
57 9 * 64.32 *57.43 No Bid
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
58 10 58.9900 47.7000 14.0000
Extended | 589.90 477.00| 140.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
59 16 35.1200 59.9500 35.6000
Extended | 561.92 959.20| 569.60 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
60 20 *50.25 *31.14 No Bid
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 6519.45 6631.11 5684.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division
Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0
61 10 *30.38 23.1800 30.4000
Extended | 0.00 231.80| 304.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
62 16 * 25.77 * 32.06 * 25.80
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
63 12 *46.97 * 46.50 No Bid
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
64 19 19.0300 * 30.93 *19.05
Extended | 361.57 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
65 12 32.5500 41.2500 * 32.55
Extended | 390.60 495.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
66 181 45.0900 34.3500 * 42.00
Extended | 8161.29 6217.35] 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
67 20 45.2300 41.1400 45.8000
Extended | 904.60 822.80| 916.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
68 100 * 13.14 *27.72 * 27.60
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
69 58 *59.92 * 41.36 * 59.20
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
70 56 15.1400 11.3100 15.2000
Extended 847.84 633.36 851.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 10665.90 8400.31 2071.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE # |631109
Vendor Auburn Supply |Dierks Wauke [Nassco Inc 0 0 0 0

71 31 90.3300 75.3600 84.4500

Extended | 2800.23 2336.16] 2617.95 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
72 95 *25.68 *17.46 * 25.90

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
73 2 * 44.49 * 60.05 No Bid

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
74 2 *79.04 *23.18 No Bid

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
75 10 107.3100 92.6000 98.6500

Extended | 1073.10 926.00| 986.50 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
76 4 * 53.08 * 41.57 No Bid

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
77 4 102.5400 * 48.98 No Bid

Extended | 410.16 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
78 2 21.7600 * 64.82 25.4000

Extended | 43.52 0.00| 50.80 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
79 4 16.2800 18.0300 21.4000

Extended | 65.12 72.12| 85.60 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
80

Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

SUBTOTAL 4392.13 3334.28 3740.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

TOTAL 52455.96 53221.52 34366.24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.
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