
Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

1 of 20

BID/QUOTE # 631108 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 11/20/2013

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Line # Qty  

1 2 41.6300 50.3200 56.7000

83.26 100.64 113.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 2 31.2600 37.9600 31.6800

62.52 75.92 63.36 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 9 43.7500 68.8000 45.9500

393.75 619.20 413.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 6 11.9600 10.7200 18.2300

71.76 64.32 109.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 7 15.0100 29.3100 13.1400

105.07 205.17 91.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 2 21.6700 26.3800 25.6900

43.34 52.76 51.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7 17 54.4300 52.7400 32.9000

925.31 896.58 559.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 7 29.4000 32.6500 27.0600

205.80 228.55 189.42 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9 14 21.8900 24.9600 27.5400

306.46 349.44 385.56 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

10 41 24.5800 24.1600 27.5900

1007.78 990.56 1131.19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3205.05 3583.14 3108.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

Zoo Foods

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Vendor #

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

11 7 24.0500 29.6000 23.7400

168.35 207.20 166.18 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12 8 21.6900 28.3800 22.1900

173.52 227.04 177.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

13 27 20.2000 24.7100 23.6900

545.40 667.17 639.63 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

14 2 65.2900 67.0400 78.3500

130.58 134.08 156.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

15 2 24.9200 33.7400 30.2800

49.84 67.48 60.56 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16 11 23.0000 23.9000 21.4500

253.00 262.90 235.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17 5 32.4500 31.1100 27.7800

162.25 155.55 138.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

18 6 26.7500 29.5800 27.4900

160.50 177.48 164.94 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19 7 13.6500 19.9400 17.3700

95.55 139.58 121.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

20 3 14.9200 11.3600 14.8200

44.76 34.08 44.46 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

1783.75 2072.56 1906.43 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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Bid Opening Results

3 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

21 4 27.8900 60.9500 32.1500

111.56 243.80 128.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

22 2 15.9000 13.6200 6.6700

31.80 27.24 13.34 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

23 10 47.1700 58.1100 52.1200

471.70 581.10 521.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

24 9 6.1800 10.1900 11.0400

55.62 91.71 99.36 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

25 1 14.2000 27.9900 19.0700

14.20 27.99 19.07 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

26 5 13.3800 23.4500 13.5700

66.90 117.25 67.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

27 15 25.8600 25.7600 17.4000

387.90 386.40 261.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

28 3 13.1500 18.4200 12.7800

39.45 55.26 38.34 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

29 4 29.9300 31.2400 25.5300

119.72 124.96 102.12 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

30 8 24.8000 44.6000 34.1900

198.40 356.80 273.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

1497.25 2012.51 1524.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

631108

Vendor

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

31 2 45.1000 44.5400 31.1300

90.20 89.08 62.26 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

32 5 63.3400 73.9800 66.7000

316.70 369.90 333.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

33 16 31.4900 36.6100 31.0900

503.84 585.76 497.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

34 13 62.1900 64.7000 54.0900

808.47 841.10 703.17 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

35 9 45.8500 51.4400 53.5100

412.65 462.96 481.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

36 160 35.0500 34.2800 22.9500

5608.00 5484.80 3672.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

37 12 52.3000 47.9000 45.3000

627.60 574.80 543.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

38 60 41.1000 49.1500 39.9300

2466.00 2949.00 2395.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

39 10 40.2900 63.4500 39.2600

402.90 634.50 392.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

40 4 42.2800 28.5100 31.5200

169.12 114.04 126.08 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

11405.48 12105.94 9208.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

5 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

41 2 60.8800 29.4300 45.1300

121.76 58.86 90.26 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

42 23 15.8300 23.3800 21.2800

364.09 537.74 489.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

43 19 16.3000 19.9000 22.6000

309.70 378.10 429.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

44 70 15.9600 20.7100 22.5200

1117.20 1449.70 1576.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

45 4 25.9000 53.9200 43.5500

103.60 215.68 174.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

46 16 28.2600 30.3900 26.9300

452.16 486.24 430.88 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

47 21 28.2600 29.7800 27.6400

593.46 625.38 580.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

48 9 21.6800 26.8200 22.6000

195.12 241.38 203.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

49 322 26.0000 51.1900 34.9500

8372.00 16483.18 11253.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

50 1100 26.0000 51.0900 34.9500

28600.00 56199.00 38445.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

40229.09 76675.26 53673.32 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

51 83 40.6500 43.5300 42.7900

3373.95 3612.99 3551.57 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

52 70 52.6700 57.7800 50.9400

3686.90 4044.60 3565.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

53 29 71.5000 76.3000 69.5100

2073.50 2212.70 2015.79 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

54 15 44.1000 54.8800 50.6700

661.50 823.20 760.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

55 98 31.5500 27.0500 23.8100

3091.90 2650.90 2333.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

56 84 54.3000 56.2400 55.6300

4561.20 4724.16 4672.92 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

57 10 38.5000 19.9000 38.4300

385.00 199.00 384.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

58 7 29.3800 31.7100 38.9500

205.66 221.97 272.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

59 10 63.0400 74.8600 49.4000

630.40 748.60 494.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

60 15 65.5000 46.1700 60.4500

982.50 692.55 906.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19652.51 19930.67 18957.21 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

61 35 43.7400 39.2300 55.2600

1530.90 1373.05 1934.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

62 45 52.9800 57.1600 46.8400

2384.10 2572.20 2107.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

63 30 44.6400 36.9100 28.1900

1339.20 1107.30 845.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

64 31 55.1500 49.5400 40.0100

1709.65 1535.74 1240.31 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

65 50 *2.00 # 66.3700 45.5100

0.00 3318.50 2275.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

66 10 29.2800 59.3300 32.5700

292.80 593.30 325.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

67 20 21.4000 38.1000 47.1800

428.00 762.00 943.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

68 10 52.3600 56.7700 49.3600

523.60 567.70 493.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

69 12 21.9000 24.7700 17.9700

262.80 297.24 215.64 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

70 20 53.4800 42.6100 34.1300

1069.60 852.20 682.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9540.65 12979.23 11064.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

71 151 32.9500 34.6700 39.9800

4975.45 5235.17 6036.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

72 150 57.6700 33.9300 37.8900

8650.50 5089.50 5683.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

73 6 29.6700 34.9200 30.6200

178.02 209.52 183.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

74 2 56.7200 56.7700 55.9900

113.44 113.54 111.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

75 18 20.1900 18.8600 26.0600

363.42 339.48 469.08 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

76 2 35.8100 23.5100 38.7200

71.62 47.02 77.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

77 7 28.8400 33.8000 39.7600

201.88 236.60 278.32 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

78 3 15.4300 10.9500 14.9300

46.29 32.85 44.79 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

79 3 44.5000 49.5100 33.5000

133.50 148.53 100.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

80 4 12.7500 12.8200 13.8600

51.00 51.28 55.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

14785.12 11503.49 13041.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

81 1 24.7500 44.6400 44.1100

24.75 44.64 44.11 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

82 20 33.3200 36.3100 24.2200

666.40 726.20 484.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

83 5 75.3000 124.9300 82.5300

376.50 624.65 412.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

84 400 41.0600 34.2400 35.7500

16424.00 13696.00 14300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

85 6 28.1200 23.5200 27.6200

168.72 141.12 165.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

86 16 36.6500 41.3300 37.9500

586.40 661.28 607.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

87 12 52.1900 54.8800 52.1700

626.28 658.56 626.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

88 68 25.3300 22.5200 21.2700

1722.44 1531.36 1446.36 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

89 14 23.4300 30.4200 18.7300

328.02 425.88 262.22 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

90 17 29.8200 23.8900 22.1300

506.94 406.13 376.21 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

21430.45 18915.82 18724.91 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

91 49 31.0300 22.9600 23.7900

1520.47 1125.04 1165.71 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

92 26 30.6900 19.7700 38.2700

797.94 514.02 995.02 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

93 42 9.3000 8.5800 27.1200

390.60 360.36 1139.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

94 7 18.5700 40.6300 21.8200

129.99 284.41 152.74 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

95 14 21.2500 22.1000 30.1700

297.50 309.40 422.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

96 7 28.0000 30.6700 23.7200

196.00 214.69 166.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

97 138 17.8500 12.7200 8.0500

2463.30 1755.36 1110.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

98 38 39.4000 43.4300 41.1000

1497.20 1650.34 1561.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

99 13 57.7600 44.7000 27.4300

750.88 581.10 356.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

100 86 18.2100 12.3300 39.7500

1566.06 1060.38 3418.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9609.94 7855.10 10488.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

133139.29 167633.72 141697.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00SUB 1-100

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

101 2 34.5000 32.2000 24.3600

69.00 64.40 48.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

102 29 16.3900 10.4700 15.6500

475.31 303.63 453.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

103 103 20.2200 8.8900 12.7700

2082.66 915.67 1315.31 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

104 116 43.0300 36.3900 30.9900

4991.48 4221.24 3594.84 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

105 20 20.6000 10.3800 23.3900

412.00 207.60 467.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

106 15 16.9500 7.2200 9.9900

254.25 108.30 149.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

107 41 18.2000 10.3800 12.2000

746.20 425.58 500.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

108 31 17.9500 18.5200 22.3400

556.45 574.12 692.54 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

109 16 40.0800 58.1900 23.5600

641.28 931.04 376.96 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

110 43 25.1600 25.2100 27.9800

1081.88 1084.03 1203.14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

11310.51 8835.61 8803.21 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

12 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

111 375 15.5100 15.0100 15.9900

5816.25 5628.75 5996.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

112 10 29.4700 24.8900 19.9900

294.70 248.90 199.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

113 17 24.8600 17.7900 16.3800

422.62 302.43 278.46 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

114 48 19.3700 21.8800 18.6500

929.76 1050.24 895.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

115 2 23.6800 22.4100 23.8800

47.36 44.82 47.76 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

116 9 13.5600 4.2400 10.4900

122.04 38.16 94.41 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

117 7 62.7700 22.2900 24.6600

439.39 156.03 172.62 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

118 10 57.5600 38.4800 38.4600

575.60 384.80 384.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

119 112 62.4700 22.3800 24.6600

6996.64 2506.56 2761.92 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

120 20 53.0700 48.1800 44.4100

1061.40 963.60 888.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16705.76 11324.29 11719.32 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

121 5 45.6100 54.5900 45.0100

228.05 272.95 225.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

122 5 29.1000 47.2400 39.4600

145.50 236.20 197.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

123 26 50.9900 44.4300 33.7900

1325.74 1155.18 878.54 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

124 27 46.9100 27.9100 31.6400

1266.57 753.57 854.28 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

125 34 50.5200 50.7500 45.7300

1717.68 1725.50 1554.82 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

126 22 54.9100 55.5900 36.8500

1208.02 1222.98 810.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

127 95 61.1100 55.0900 33.8800

5805.45 5233.55 3218.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

128 1 17.9000 27.2700 70.5200

17.90 27.27 70.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

129 4 30.0500 51.6800 67.9300

120.20 206.72 271.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

130 4 84.7100 36.2300 35.2500

338.84 144.92 141.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12173.95 10978.84 8222.53 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Vendor

Extended

Extended

631108

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

131 6 43.1800 48.6800 44.5400

259.08 292.08 267.24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

132 14 61.8600 72.8400 63.8200

866.04 1019.76 893.48 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

133 1 11.9000 42.8700 46.7600

11.90 42.87 46.76 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

134 5 46.8700 46.5000 40.8400

234.35 232.50 204.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

135 24 38.2500 36.0800 37.0200

918.00 865.92 888.48 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

136 127 51.7300 41.8700 35.9500

6569.71 5317.49 4565.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

137 71 59.5700 43.4100 42.3600

4229.47 3082.11 3007.56 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

138 2500 1.3300 1.3000 1.1300

3325.00 3250.00 2825.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

139 900 1.3300 1.2700 1.1100

1197.00 1143.00 999.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

140 57 36.0000 39.5400 37.3900

2052.00 2253.78 2131.23 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19662.55 17499.51 15828.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

15 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

141 200 43.1500 34.3000 39.9500

8630.00 6860.00 7990.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

142 400 48.0200 25.9900 35.2900

19208.00 10396.00 14116.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

143 93 36.8500 24.0700 34.6300

3427.05 2238.51 3220.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

144 34 26.2700 26.9300 22.5800

893.18 915.62 767.72 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

145 55 27.7200 23.2600 29.9800

1524.60 1279.30 1648.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

146 1875 26.8700 21.9600 17.7500

50381.25 41175.00 33281.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

147 6 29.9500 30.0200 29.7900

179.70 180.12 178.74 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

148 177 65.2200 58.7200 57.4900

11543.94 10393.44 10175.73 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

149 163 27.8900 27.0900 19.9900

4546.07 4415.67 3258.37 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

150 465 10.8800 11.8300 8.7500

5059.20 5500.95 4068.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

105392.99 83354.61 78706.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

16 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

151 37 50.1000 35.4400 24.3500

1853.70 1311.28 900.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

152 12 36.2000 31.0800 33.2500

434.40 372.96 399.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

153 11 22.1100 21.5100 22.8800

243.21 236.61 251.68 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

154 6 15.7400 15.6400 14.5700

94.44 93.84 87.42 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

155 28 24.7600 31.9300 18.6600

693.28 894.04 522.48 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

156 20 27.2900 27.6800 29.0800

545.80 553.60 581.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

157 7 20.7000 23.1200 21.5000

144.90 161.84 150.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

158 10 20.7000 25.7100 24.6500

207.00 257.10 246.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

159 10 19.3000 13.1100 23.2200

193.00 131.10 232.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

160 2 25.5300 22.3700 25.3000

51.06 44.74 50.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4460.79 4057.11 3422.93 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Vendor

631108

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

17 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

161 10 16.5000 13.3600 17.4600

165.00 133.60 174.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

162 4 49.3000 56.0000 5.6000

197.20 224.00 22.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

163 8 37.7500 40.9300 44.1600

302.00 327.44 353.28 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

164 96 25.8000 26.1100 26.3900

2476.80 2506.56 2533.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

165 3 34.3100 24.0100 36.8000

102.93 72.03 110.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

166 433 32.3500 19.7200 30.5500

14007.55 8538.76 13228.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

167 2 29.7600 38.5000 37.7500

59.52 77.00 75.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

168 300 18.9000 25.8000 17.3500

5670.00 7740.00 5205.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

169 6 27.9800 29.6400 28.1000

167.88 177.84 168.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

170 90 46.0600 43.0800 42.8900

4145.40 3877.20 3860.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

27294.28 23674.43 25731.47 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

18 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

171 20 49.1900 71.4200 48.7700

983.80 1428.40 975.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

172 20 49.3100 52.2900 48.4500

986.20 1045.80 969.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

173 16 26.9800 42.4200 25.3500

431.68 678.72 405.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

174 18 20.4100 22.2500 19.4300

367.38 400.50 349.74 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

175 14 50.1100 55.0700 58.5100

701.54 770.98 819.14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

176 10 51.9000 72.1900 77.4400

519.00 721.90 774.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

177 822 2.1100 2.6700 2.4200

1734.42 2194.74 1989.24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

178 64 26.9600 36.0200 27.4600

1725.44 2305.28 1757.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

179 5 24.0500 21.6400 17.3000

120.25 108.20 86.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

180 18 18.5000 27.4900 17.1800

333.00 494.82 309.24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7902.71 10149.34 8435.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

19 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

181 12 15.7000 17.6200 12.0500

188.40 211.44 144.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

182 44 13.2500 26.7300 12.6600

583.00 1176.12 557.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

183 25 16.4000 15.9800 16.4100

410.00 399.50 410.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

184 27 27.7700 27.4900 29.9400

749.79 742.23 808.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

185 10 14.8300 15.4600 28.9900

148.30 154.60 289.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

186 5 10.4000 11.1300 25.7200

52.00 55.65 128.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

187 20 14.1300 10.1400 18.0400

282.60 202.80 360.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

188 16 21.2600 21.7100 19.7800

340.16 347.36 316.48 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

189 14 21.5400 18.1500 16.1700

301.56 254.10 226.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

190 18 21.3400 23.1400 19.1500

384.12 416.52 344.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3439.93 3960.32 3587.13 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

631108

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

20 of 20

BID/QUOTE #

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food 0 0 0 0

191 2 61.7500 56.6700 72.1100

123.50 113.34 144.22 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

192 1 54.4000 39.3800 61.0400

54.40 39.38 61.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

193 1 57.0500 53.9200 56.0300

57.05 53.92 56.03 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

194 200 49.8100 54.1000 53.3800

9962.00 10820.00 10676.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

195 10 68.5300 55.1900 51.6800

685.30 551.90 516.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

196 5 56.8600 41.8600 57.4000

284.30 209.30 287.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

197 5 85.4800 142.2500 78.5400

427.40 711.25 392.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

198 10 31.6500 59.3500 42.7400

316.50 593.50 427.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

199 10 16.7500 23.5200 24.9600

167.50 235.20 249.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

200 5 45.3200 26.0400 36.0800

226.60 130.20 180.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12304.55 13457.99 12991.19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

353787.31 354925.77 319145.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Extended

631108

Extended

SUBTOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

TOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Tabulation Sheet

1 of 1

BID/QUOTE # 631108 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 11/20/2013

Dierks Wauke Sysco Gordon Food

Line # Qty  

1 10 61.6600 73.9000 66.2800

616.60 739.00 662.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 5 65.3500 46.8100 49.8800

326.75 234.05 249.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 5 No Bid 33.1000 63.9100

0.00 165.50 319.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 5 No Bid 60.2400 59.7800

0.00 301.20 298.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

10

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

943.35 1439.75 1530.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Vendor

Extended

Zoo Foods

Extended

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

TOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date.  Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. 
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