Milwaukee County Procurement Division lof2
Bid Opening Results
BID/QUOTE # |641203 COMMODITY: |0 OPEN DATE: 7/11/2014
Vendor E.R.Abernathy [E.R.Abernathy |Royal Paper |Eclipse Distrib [SuperiorEquip |Central Poly DynaPakCorp
Vendor # Not As Spec
Terms NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
Line # |Qty
1 844 59.7700 49.1100 54.2800 41.8000 50.9700 34.8000 37.6000
Extended | 50445.88 41448.84] 45812.32 35279.20| 43018.68 29371.20| 31734.40
2 8 NO/BID NO/BID 40.7100 31.0500 38.2300 23.8000 36.0000
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 325.68 248.40| 305.84 190.40| 288.00
3 537 37.5700 31.2800 31.7300 21.5400 29.9900 24.1000 23.4000
Extended | 20175.09 16797.36| 17039.01 11566.98| 16104.63 12941.70| 12565.80
4 106 56.8000 46.5700 52.2200 42.0500 49.0100 32.4000 42.9000
Extended | 6020.80 4936.42] 5535.32 4457.30| 5195.06 3434.40| 4547.40
5 2836 52.1800 42.9300 47.3300 37.7400 44.3900 26.8000 32.8000
Extended | 147982.48 121749.48| 134227.88 107030.64)| 125890.04 76004.80| 93020.80
6 1 77.4500 58.1300 37.0000 51.0000 69.0600 37.9000 NO/BID
Extended | 77.45 58.13] 37.00 51.00] 69.06 37.90| 0.00
7 90 98.6900 47.2800 35.5000 72.7500 88.2900 53.8000 40.3500
Extended | 8882.10 4255.20| 3195.00 6547.50| 7946.10 4842.00| 3631.50
8 520 39.0800 32.5100 33.4500 24.8600 31.3700 37.9000 26.4000
Extended | 20321.60 16905.20| 17394.00 12927.20| 16312.40 19708.00| 13728.00
9 399 25.4200 31.7400 15.3800 21.7500 19.2500 18.8000 17.9000
Extended | 10142.58 12664.26 6136.62 8678.25| 7680.75 7501.20| 7142.10
10/ 1 34.1600 30.8900 30.4600 21.5400 25.1400 22.5000 NO/BID
Extended 34.16 30.89 30.46 21.54 25.14 22.50 0.00
SUBTOTAL 264082.14 218845.78 229733.29 186808.01 222547.70 154054.10 166658.00
BUYER NAME: PHONE:
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated below for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |641203
Vendor E.R.Abernathy [E.R.Abernathy |Royal Paper |Eclipse Distrib [SuperiorEquip |Central Poly DynaPakCorp
11 34 67.5300 54.4600 18.5500 17.0500 58.8100 32.1000 57.4200
Extended | 2296.02 1851.64| 630.70 579.70| 1999.54 1091.40| 1952.28
12 150 52.1800 43.3300 27.4300 35.7400 44.3900 25.8000 35.0000
Extended | 7827.00 6499.50| 4114.50 5361.00| 6658.50 3870.00| 5250.00
13 1 50.1300 41.5000 40.7100 50.9500 41.4200 25.6000 NO/BID
Extended | 50.13 41.50| 40.71 50.95| 41.42 25.60 0.00
14 1 52.0800 40.1000 42.4200 43.2000 43.5600 20.4000 NO/BID
Extended | 52.08 40.10| 42.42 43.20| 43.56 20.40] 0.00
15 1 56.9400 46.1800 35.5000 57.5000 48.2200 59.0000 NO/BID
Extended | 56.94 46.18] 35.50 57.50| 48.22 59.00 0.00
16 1 56.9400 45.5500 35.5000 54.9500 48.2200 54.0000 NO/BID
Extended | 56.94 4555 35.50 54.95| 48.22 54.00 0.00
17
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
18
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
19
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
20
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 10339.11 8524.47 4899.33 6147.30 8839.46 5120.40 7202.28
TOTAL 274421.25 227370.25 234632.62 192955.31 231387.16 159174.50 173860.28
* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated below for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |641203 COMMODITY: [Liners - Refuse Plastic Polyethylene OPEN DATE: 7/11/2014
Vendor San-A-Care All American  |Quest Co. Interboro Kranz Inc. Prof.Business |[Clean Rite
Vendor # 3 DAYS 10-14 DAYS |5 Days NAS
Terms NET 30 1% 10 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
Line # |Qty
1 844 50.4300 37.4700 47.2900 32.8400 47.8800 68.8800 44.0200
Extended | 42562.92 31624.68]| 39912.76 27716.96| 40410.72 58134.72] 37152.88
2 8 NO/BID 27.7800 38.3300 26.4800 35.8500 104.7300 33.6600
Extended | 0.00 222.24] 306.64 211.84] 286.80 837.84| 269.28
3 537 29.1400 20.7200 28.4000 21.4800 28.8800 38.4000 24.9500
Extended | 15648.18 11126.64)| 15250.80 11534.76| 15508.56 20620.80| 13398.15
4 106 50.3700 36.9400 45.4700 33.8200 45.9300 66.0000 44.0600
Extended | 5339.22 3915.64)| 4819.82 3584.92| 4868.58 6996.00| 4670.36
5 2836 43.2300 31.7900 41.2000 26.6800 41.7300 59.8000 38.4200
Extended | 122600.28 90156.44| 116843.20 75664.48] 118346.28 169592.80| 108959.12
6 1 63.7400 54.4600 62.0000 39.9800 NO/BID 89.6000 56.6500
Extended | 63.74 54.46| 62.00 39.98| 0.00 89.60| 56.65
7 90 66.7800 90.0000 82.3900 51.2400 72.3700 119.6000 58.7600
Extended | 6010.20 8100.00| 7415.10 4611.60| 6513.30 10764.00| 5288.40
8 520 30.5700 22.0300 29.0900 18.7200 29.4000 42.2000 26.9600
Extended | 15896.40 11455.60| 15126.80 9734.40| 15288.00 21944.00| 14019.20
9 399 21.1700 23.5800 19.8300 15.8400 19.8000 34.4000 18.4600
Extended | 8446.83 9408.42| 7912.17 6320.16| 7900.20 13725.60| 7365.54
10/ 1 27.8700 23.9800 27.3200 23.8200 28.6200 30.4000 24.2200
Extended 27.87 23.98 27.32 23.82 28.62 30.40 24.22
SUBTOTAL 216595.64 166088.10 207676.61 139442.92 209151.06 302735.76 191203.80
BUYER NAME: PHONE:
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated below for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |641203
Vendor San-A-Care All American |Quest Co. Interboro Kranz Inc. Prof.Business |[Clean Rite
11 34 58.1400 46.1800 53.2400 38.8200 37.8800 63.3600 50.6500
Extended | 1976.76 1570.12| 1810.16 1319.88| 1287.92 2154.24] 1722.10
12 150 42.5500 30.9200 39.2000 27.7200 36.6100 47.8400 36.6800
Extended | 6382.50 4638.00| 5880.00 4158.00| 5491.50 7176.00| 5502.00
13 1 42.0200 31.0800 38.7300 27.8200 35.8500 55.8000 37.3400
Extended | 42.02 31.08| 38.73 27.82| 35.85 55.80 37.34
14 1 42.0200 40.2900 38.4300 23.7400 NO/BID 55.8000 37.3400
Extended | 42.02 40.29| 38.43 23.74] 0.00 55.80 37.34
15 1 NO/BID 35.4800 43.7800 28.3200 NO/BID 63.4900 41.6800
Extended | 0.00 35.48)| 43.78 28.32| 0.00 63.49)] 41.68
16 1 46.1500 32.6400 42.0000 27.3400 NO/BID 50.8000 40.6800
Extended | 46.15 32.64| 42.00 27.34] 0.00 50.80 40.68
17
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
18/
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
19
Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
20
Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 8489.45 6347.61 7853.10 5585.10 6815.27 9556.13 7381.14
TOTAL 225085.09 172435.71 215529.71 145028.02 215966.33 312291.89 198584.94
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated below for award results.
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