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BID/QUOTE # |631110 COMMODITY: PRINTING PAPER OPEN DATE: 12/5/2013
Vendor E.R.Abernathy [Midland Paper |Lindenmeyr Unisource Montenegro
Vendor #
Terms  [NET 30 1% 30 1% 30 1% 30 1% 30
Line # |Qty
1 1200 7.3000 5.5700 5.2000 5.3700 6.1200
Extended | 8760.00 6684.00| 6240.00 6444.00| 7344.00 0.00| 0.00
2 90 14.2200 7.6000 8.2500 7.5600 8.7700
Extended | 1279.80 684.00| 742.50 680.40| 789.30 0.00| 0.00
3 500 29.4300 8.2000 17.3500 16.0800 17.3500
Extended | 14715.00 4100.00| 8675.00 8040.00| 8675.00 0.00| 0.00
4 80 66.5400 35.5000 37.2000 35.2300 42.1000
Extended | 5323.20 2840.00| 2976.00 2818.40| 3368.00 0.00| 0.00
5 15 26.1600 13.9500 12.5500 13.0100 12.3600
Extended | 392.40 209.25| 188.25 195.15| 185.40 0.00| 0.00
6 1550 45.7800 17.7000 14.2600 13.9700 14.0800
Extended | 70959.00 27435.00| 22103.00 21653.50| 21824.00 0.00| 0.00
7 1035 49.0500 20.0400 16.0700 15.7100 15.5400
Extended | 50766.75 20741.40| 16632.45 16259.85| 16083.90 0.00| 0.00
8 30 49.0500 20.0400 16.0700 16.0100 14.7000
Extended | 1471.50 601.20| 482.10 480.30| 441.00 0.00| 0.00
9 300 54.7700 21.3900 17.2000 16.8000 15.3700
Extended | 16431.00 6417.00| 5160.00 5040.00| 4611.00 0.00| 0.00
10 25 56.4100 22.1400 17.8200 17.8000 16.1200
Extended 1410.25 553.50 445 50 445.00 403.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 171508.90 70265.35 63644.80 62056.60 63724.60 0.00 0.00
BUYER NAME: PHONE:
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |631110
Vendor E.R.Abernathy [Midland Paper |Lindenmeyr Unisource Montenegro 0 0
11 105 57.2300 19.9800 15.9600 15.9200 14.5100
Extended | 6009.15 2097.90| 1675.80 1671.60| 1523.55 0.00] 0.00
12 10 64.5800 20.2400 16.1700 17.2500 14.8300
Extended | 645.80 202.40| 161.70 172.50| 148.30 0.00] 0.00
13 20.5 65.4000 24.2400 19.3300 20.1500 17.3800
Extended | 1340.70 496.92] 396.27 413.08] 356.29 0.00] 0.00
14 455 40.0600 14.2900 11.4300 11.9100 10.4800
Extended | 1822.73 650.20| 520.07 541.91] 476.84 0.00] 0.00
15 125 138.9800 43.1400 35.9600 38.9700 35.0900
Extended | 1737.25 539.25| 449.50 487.13] 438.63 0.00] 0.00
16 32 65.4000 25.2000 32.2000 32.1400 27.1700
Extended | 2092.80 806.40| 1030.40 1028.48| 869.44 0.00| 0.00
17 45 70.3100 24.4800 19.5400 20.3200 17.9300
Extended | 3163.95 1101.60| 879.30 914.40| 806.85 0.00] 0.00
18 76 45.7800 14.5800 12.5700 16.4500 10.4500
Extended | 3479.28 1108.08| 955.32 1250.20| 794.20 0.00] 0.00
19 1.7 224.0000 124.9500 111.4000 105.7000 147.6600
Extended | 380.80 212.42] 189.38 179.69| 251.02 0.00] 0.00
20 6.575 343.3500 190.2500 184.8500 211.0000 216.3500
Extended 2257.53 1250.89 1215.39 1387.33 1422.50 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 22929.99 8466.06 7473.13 8046.32 7087.62 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |631110
Vendor E.R.Abernathy [Midland Paper |Lindenmeyr Unisource Montenegro 0 0
21 86 46.1100 25.4800 26.4500 28.3800 30.5400
Extended | 3965.46 2191.28| 2274.70 2440.68| 2626.44 0.00] 0.00
22 221.5 73.5800 29.4800 25.3600 23.1600 28.2000
Extended | 16297.97 6529.82] 5617.24 5129.94] 6246.30 0.00| 0.00
23 110.5 129.1700 58.2400 48.9500 43.9500 55.0500
Extended | 14273.29 6435.52] 5408.98 4856.48| 6083.03 0.00] 0.00
24 16 169.2200 81.9000 9.4500 116.0000 7.2900
Extended | 2707.52 1310.40| 151.20 1856.00| 116.64 0.00] 0.00
25/ 4 88.2900 61.8000 57.1000 75.0000 55.3400
Extended | 353.16 247.20| 228.40 300.00| 221.36 0.00] 0.00
26 31 93.2000 63.9000 54.9000 65.0000 54.7600
Extended | 2889.20 1980.90| 1701.90 2015.00| 1697.56 0.00| 0.00
27/ 9 102.1900 70.4000 60.6000 71.8000 61.1200
Extended | 919.71 633.60| 545.40 646.20| 550.08 0.00] 0.00
28 3 29.8300 16.8400 24.0000 16.0000 18.7500
Extended | 89.49 50.52| 72.00 48.00| 56.25 0.00] 0.00
29 35 325.3700 216.2400 200.8500 194.7500 210.0100
Extended | 1138.80 756.84| 702.98 681.63] 735.04 0.00| 0.00
30 13.5 420.3700 278.9800 253.6500 251.3000 270.9900
Extended 5675.00 3766.23 3424.28 3392.55 3658.37 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 48309.60 23902.31 20127.08 21366.48 21991.07 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.
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BID/QUOTE # |631110

Vendor E.R.Abernathy [Midland Paper |Lindenmeyr Unisource Montenegro 0 0
31 100 28.3600 18.7800 17.5000 16.8100 18.1300

Extended | 2836.00 1878.00| 1750.00 1681.00| 1813.00 0.00] 0.00
32 2 423.4700 266.2400 253.6000 243.4500 248.5400

Extended | 846.94 532.48] 507.20 486.90| 497.08 0.00] 0.00
33 565 19.9500 12.3800 12.5000 11.1800 13.2100

Extended | 11271.75 6994.70| 7062.50 6316.70| 7463.65 0.00] 0.00
34 575 12.3800 12.5000 11.1800 13.6500

Extended | 0.00 7118.50| 7187.50 6428.50| 7848.75 0.00] 0.00
35 100 12.8900 7.7400 8.0000 7.5700 8.6500

Extended | 1289.00 774.00| 800.00 757.00| 865.00 0.00] 0.00
36 300 31.4600 25.4800 19.9000 19.4400 24.3400

Extended | 9438.00 7644.00| 5970.00 5832.00| 7302.00 0.00| 0.00
37 100 12.1100 6.5400 7.7500 5.8300 6.8400

Extended | 1211.00 654.00| 775.00 583.00| 684.00 0.00] 0.00
38

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00
39

Extended | 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00] 0.00
40

Extended 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

SUBTOTAL 26892.69 25595.68 24052.20 22085.10 26473.48 0.00 0.00
TOTAL 269641.18 128229.40 115297.21 113554.50 119276.77 0.00 0.00
* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please
contact buyer indicated for award results.
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