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Bid Opening Results

1 of 2  

BID/QUOTE # 62150001 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 3/11/2015
Alpha Baking Gordon Food Papas Bakery Cooking Incub

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Line # Qty  

1 175 4.9900 No Bid 2.6300 4.1500
873.25 0.00 460.25 726.25 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 6744 3.0000 *0.158 1.6300 5.1600
20232.00 0.00 10992.72 34799.04 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 7961 1.4400 *0.1355 1.6100 5.0400
11463.84 0.00 12817.21 40123.44 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 2032 0.9000 No Bid 0.3700 0.8900
1828.80 0.00 751.84 1808.48 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 4408 0.8500 No Bid 0.3500 0.8800
3746.80 0.00 1542.80 3879.04 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 2322 0.6000 No Bid 0.5000 0.8900
1393.20 0.00 1161.00 2066.58 0.00 0.00 0.00

7 1506 0.7500 No Bid 0.4700 0.9800
1129.50 0.00 707.82 1475.88 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 650 0.9500 No Bid 0.8700 1.1700
617.50 0.00 565.50 760.50 0.00 0.00 0.00

9 175 3.4000 No Bid 2.6300 3.3600
595.00 0.00 460.25 588.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

10 718 3.3000 No Bid 2.6300 4.1500
2369.40 0.00 1888.34 2979.70 0.00 0.00 0.00

44249.29 0.00 31347.73 89206.91 0.00 0.00 0.00

Vendor

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Bread

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

Extended

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

Terms

Extended
SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid
NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 
contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]
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BID/QUOTE #
Alpha Baking Gordon Food Papas Bakery Cooking Incub 0 0 0

11 600 0.5500 No Bid 0.6900 0.6100
330.00 0.00 414.00 366.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12 1456 0.3800 *0.3695 0.3500 0.3100
553.28 0.00 509.60 451.36 0.00 0.00 0.00

13 800 0.7500 No Bid 0.5600 0.7400
600.00 0.00 448.00 592.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

14 700 3.4000 No Bid 2.6300 4.3900
2380.00 0.00 1841.00 3073.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

15
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

18
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

20
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3863.28 0.00 3212.60 4482.36 0.00 0.00 0.00
48112.57 0.00 34560.33 93689.27 0.00 0.00 0.00
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62150001
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* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid
NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 
contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]


