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BID/QUOTE # 61150005 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 4/30/2015
Univar USA Pool Doctors Lenny's Pool

Net 30 5% 10 Net 30
Line # Qty  

1 2.9600 2.0000 2.0000
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 No Bid 2.9375 2.9375
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 No Bid No Bid 1.9800
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 No Bid No Bid 1.9800
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 No Bid No Bid 1.7500
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 No Bid No Bid 0.3466
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7 No Bid No Bid 0.5200
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 No Bid No Bid 2.8800
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

10
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

TOTAL
Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

Extended

Pool Chemicals

Extended

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

* = See Bid
# = Alternate Bid
NB = No Bid
NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date.  Please 
contact buyer indicated for award results. 


