
Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

1 of 2  

BID/QUOTE # 131101 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 7/24/2013

Legacy Comm Lifeline Audio EchibitOne Select Sound Wash ington PSI Business 

2% 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Line # Qty  

1 48 201.4550 135.0000 146.1600 167.0000 131.0000 160.4400 259.9800

9669.84 6480.00 7015.68 8016.00 6288.00 7701.12 12479.04

2 60 201.4550 217.0000 191.4000 184.1900 164.0000 191.1000 189.9800

12087.30 13020.00 11484.00 11051.40 9840.00 11466.00 11398.80

3 60 113.7163 102.0000 110.2000 116.5100 99.0000 109.6200 132.9800

6822.98 6120.00 6612.00 6990.60 5940.00 6577.20 7978.80

4 12 397.2100 376.0000 404.8400 419.7300 351.0000 375.8800 529.9800

4766.52 4512.00 4858.08 5036.76 4212.00 4510.56 6359.76

5 12 1531.5300 976.0000 1298.0400 1466.8800 1217.0000 1153.3300 1589.9800

18378.36 11712.00 15576.48 17602.56 14604.00 13839.96 19079.76

6 12 1779.0500 1411.0000 1506.8400 1700.1600 1422.0000 1625.0000 No Bid

21348.60 16932.00 18082.08 20401.92 17064.00 19500.00 0.00

7 12 297.5000 238.0000 249.4000 295.3000 235.0000 270.0000 339.9800

3570.00 2856.00 2992.80 3543.60 2820.00 3240.00 4079.76

8 12 236.2150 234.0000 200.5100 376.3000 211.0000 217.0200 269.9800

2834.58 2808.00 2406.12 4515.60 2532.00 2604.24 3239.76

9 12 83.5383 79.0000 75.4000 80.2100 68.0000 88.5900 89.9800

1002.46 948.00 904.80 962.52 816.00 1063.08 1079.76

10 36 7.4375 8.0000 7.2500 8.1300 10.0000 15.1500 No Bid

267.75 288.00 261.00 292.68 360.00 545.40 0.00

80748.39 65676.00 70193.04 78413.64 64476.00 71047.56 65695.44

Vendor

Extended

Speakers (Electronic)

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

Extended

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

2 of 2  

BID/QUOTE #

Legacy Comm Lifeline Audio EchibitOne Select Sound Wash ington PSI Business 

11

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

13

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

14

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

15

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

18

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

20

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

80748.39 65676.00 70193.04 78413.64 64476.00 71047.56 65695.44

Extended

Extended

Extended

131101

Extended

TOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

1 of 2  

BID/QUOTE # 131101 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 7/24/2013

Good Sound Studio Gear B & H Phoio Full Compass Pro SVL Audio Visual Troxell Comm

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Line # Qty  

1 48 No Bid 180.0000 142.9900 143.6400 127.2800 125.6600 No Bid

0.00 8640.00 6863.52 6894.72 6109.44 6031.68 0.00

2 60 143.9700 222.0000 149.9900 169.2900 160.9100 152.4500 168.8100

8638.20 13320.00 8999.40 10157.40 9654.60 9147.00 10128.60

3 60 82.9700 120.0000 82.9900 95.5600 87.2500 92.9300 100.6100

4978.20 7200.00 4979.40 5733.60 5235.00 5575.80 6036.60

4 12 304.9700 430.0000 301.0000 333.7900 326.4000 341.4100 349.4400

3659.64 5160.00 3612.00 4005.48 3916.80 4096.92 4193.28

5 12 No Bid 1010.0000 No Bid No Bid 1162.8400 1216.3000 No Bid

0.00 12120.00 0.00 0.00 13954.08 14595.60 0.00

6 12 No Bid 1410.0000 No Bid No Bid 1349.8900 1411.9600 No Bid

0.00 16920.00 0.00 0.00 16198.68 16943.52 0.00

7 12 No Bid 250.0000 No Bid No Bid 223.4200 233.7000 No Bid

0.00 3000.00 0.00 0.00 2681.04 2804.40 0.00

8 12 No Bid 230.0000 No Bid 198.5000 178.4700 209.9900 250.4700

0.00 2760.00 0.00 2382.00 2141.64 2519.88 3005.64

9 12 No Bid 76.0000 77.0000 68.6400 67.5400 70.6500 76.1200

0.00 912.00 924.00 823.68 810.48 847.80 913.44

10 36 No Bid 8.0000 No Bid No Bid 6.4900 No Bid No Bid

0.00 288.00 0.00 0.00 233.64 0.00 0.00

17276.04 70320.00 25378.32 29996.88 60935.40 62562.60 24277.56

Vendor

Extended

Speakers (Electronic)

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

Extended

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Opening Results

2 of 2  

BID/QUOTE #

Good Sound Studio Gear B & H Phoio Full Compass Pro SVL Audio Visual Troxell Comm

11

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

13

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

14

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

15

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

18

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

20

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17276.04 70320.00 25378.32 29996.88 60935.40 62562.60 24277.56

Extended

Extended

Extended

131101

Extended

TOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor

SUBTOTAL

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date. Please 

contact buyer indicated below for award results. ]



Milwaukee County Procurement Division

Bid Tabulation Sheet

1 of 1

BID/QUOTE # 131101 COMMODITY: OPEN DATE: 7/24/2013

All Pro Sound

Net 30

Line # Qty  

1 48 133.0000

6384.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 60 153.0000

9180.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 60 89.7200

5383.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 12 266.0000

3192.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 12 978.0000

11736.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 12 1412.0000

16944.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7 12 234.0000

2808.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 12 183.0000

2196.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9 12 71.0000

852.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

10 36 6.0000

216.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

58891.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Vendor

Extended

Speakers (Electronic)

Extended

Terms

Extended

Extended

Extended

Vendor #

BUYER NAME:____________________________________PHONE:__________________

TOTAL

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

* = See Bid

# = Alternate Bid

NB = No Bid

NOTE: These are bid opening tabulation results only, however, determination of award will be made at a later date.  Please 

contact buyer indicated for award results. 
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