BID SUMMARY

PROJECT NAME:

Calvin Moody Park Community Building, Splash Pad & Park Renovation RE-BID

PROJECT NO. P191-11437
BIDS DUE: Wednesday, August 27, 2014 @ 2PM
: CONTRACT 1 | CONTRACT 2 | CONTRACT 3
CONTRACT #: 1 Alt 1 Alt 2 Alt 3 Alt 4 Alt 5 Alt 6 Alt 7 Alt 8 Alt 9 Alt 10 DBE
BASE BID BASE BID BASE BID — - I — I - I — - — REC'D

J.H. Hassinger NO-BID NO-BID $2,299,221.00 $20,000.00 $65,000.00 $9,000.00 ($70,000.00) $70,000.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 $15,000.00 $90,000.00 ($35,000.00)

VJS Construction

Arteaga Construction
KPH Construction $1,223,651.00 NO-BID NO-BID X
JP Cullen & Sons NO-BID NO-BID $2,098,089.00 $14,575.00 $38,759.00 $2,718.00 ($77,137.00) $75,577.00 $16,920.00 $28,137.00 $10,290.00 $0.00 ($57,196.00) X

Veit & Company

Burkhart Construction

Habermehl Electric

DBE 25%
ADDENDUMS Four (4)

BASE BID DESCRIPTION:

Work Consists of complete park renovation, construction of an approximately 3,000 square foot community building, parking lot, outdoor splash pad with small playground, open air performance structure, basketball courts, pathways, site lighting, exercise
station, park landscaping, and field sports.

CBDP concurs with the DBE participation for the above recommended Bid. Please refer to the approved Form DBD-014C attached to the bid recommendation.




