BID SUMMARY

PROJECT NAME:

Redundant Main Electrical Service Feed - GMIA

PROJECT NO. A138-09006

BIDS DUE: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.
CONTRACT i BASE BID DBE REC'D
PIEPER ELECTRIC $7,191,640.00 | $1,058,956.00 | $1,277,448.00 $993,150.00 $87,567.00 $117,250.00 NO BID $34,737.00 $35,078.00 $87,931.00 $291,062.00 $35,840.00
STAFF ELECTRIC CO
VENTURE ELECTRIC
WIL-SURGE $5,997,104.00 | $1,116,311.00 | $1,371,440.00 | $1,063,787.00 $94,760.00 $112.611.00 NO BID NO BID $37,658.00 $107.672.00 $314,730.00 $9,473.00
J P CULLEN & SONS INC $5,008,796.00 | $1,140,000.00 | $1,375,000.00 | $1,085000.00 $111,900.00 $141,500.00 NO BID $41,500.00 $37.800.00 $50,600.00 $225,500.00 $20,000.00
THE RYAN COMPANY INC
CD SMITH $5,767,000.00 | $1,100,000.00 1,330,000.00 | $1,032.000.00 $91,000.00 $122.000.00 NO BID $36,000.00 $36,000.00 $76.000.00 $215,000.00 $37,000.00
ARTEAGA CONSTRUCTION

DBE 25

ADDENDUMS 3

BASE BID DESCRIPTION:

The work under this contract will consist of installing concrete-encased electrical and communications duct banks along the west and south sides of the parking structure. Provide and install new Primary switchgear for 2
new WE Energies lines. Provide and install a new building to house the switchgear, and owner provided generator and communications room. Provide and Install Skv feeders to existing switchgear in the terminal, and
parking structure.

The DBD Department concurs with the DBE participation for the above recommended Bid. Please refer to the approved Form DBD-014C attached to the bid recommendation.
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